
Bid Tab - Chemical Bid 2024-2025
Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #

Sub 
Allowed

Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Brady Plus Buckeye Clayton Paper Hillyard ImperialDade Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

Chemical 0

A-01
Take Down Fresh & 

Clean
Gal Hillyard HIL0046806 NO NO 30 $28.74 Hillyard $28.74

A-02
Scenturion (Odor 

Counteractant)
Gal Buckeye 54351000 NO NO 50 $99.89 (4 x 1 Gal) Buckeye $99.89

A-03
Consumer Spartan 

Chemical
4 - 1 Gallon 

Bottles
Spartan SP3097 NO NO 50 309704 - $49.32

/case
SP3097-4 - 

$46.90 $45.65 $45.83 ImperialDade $45.65

A-04
Clorox 360 Chemical, 

Clorox total 360
Case NO NO 20 31650 - $71.39

/case
CL31650 - 

$69.40 Brady Plus $71.39

A-05 Restroom Cleaner 21 oz. - Case of 12
Comet/AJax- 
Powder - No 

LIquid
NO NO 75 32987 - $1.89 each 

or $22.68 for 12
CPC14278CT - 

$34.30
AJAX (24 PER 
CASE) - $37.17

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 
Paper & 

ImperialDade

$22.68/12, 
$34.30 & 
$37.17/24

A-06

Sanicare DRC 
(Disinfectanta 

REstoom Cleaner - 
Liquid)

Gal Buckeye 52700600 NO NO 50 $45.39 (4 x 1 Gal) Buckeye $45.39

A-07
Neutral Floor Clean 

E33
5 Gal Buckeye 60331400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-08
TriBase Multi 

Purpose Cleaner 17
4 - 1 Gallon 

Bottles
Spartan SP4830 NO NO 50 483002 - $51.11

/case
SP4830-CG - 

$52.87

Spartan# 3830 is 
Gal not 4830 - 

$44.70
$47.50 ImperialDade $44.70

Concentrated Dispenser Chemicals and unit $3.00

A-09 Carpet Spotter Case YES YES 50 FCCCSH1 - $29.76
/case

SP3137-12 - 
$33.24

Tripls S 
Bioenzymatic - 
12 quarts per 
case - $77.59

Brady Plus $29.76

A-10
Gone H202 12x1 

(Carpet Spot Cleaner)
Qt Buckeye 53760600 NO NO 50 $75.89 (12 x 1) Buckeye $75.89

A-11
Green solutions 
Carpet Cleaner

4 - 1 Gallon 
Bottles

Spartan SP350904 NO NO 50 350904 - $52.34
/case

SP3509-4 - 
$56.70 $49.39 $49.89 ImperialDade $49.39

A-12 Carpet Pre-Spray Case Hillyard HIL0081425 NO NO 20 $111.40 Hillyard $111.40
A-13 Neutralizer Case Hillyard HIL0081825 NO NO 20 $139.27 Hillyard $139.27

A-14 Shineline Floor Prep
4 - 1 Gallon 

Bottles
Spartan SP3029 NO NO 50 302904 - $28.36

/case
SP3029-4 - 

$30.10 $28.12 $27.08 Royal Paper $27.08

A-15 Recoat Prep Case Hillyard HIL0083425 NO NO 50 $105.08 Hillyard $105.08

A-16
All-Purpose Cleaner - 

E11 
Case Buckeye 60111400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-17 Spray Clean HD Case Hillyard HIL0182025 NO NO 50 $213.48 Hillyard $213.48

A-18
Multi Surface 

Cleaner 4 | Spartan 
Chemical

4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4740 NO NO 50 474002 - $52.65
/case

SP4740-CG - 
$55.80 $45.95 $50.14 ImperialDade $45.95

A-19 Super Shine-All Case Hillyard HIL0080825 NO NO 20 $107.68 Hillyard $107.68

A-20 Damp Mop 8 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4736 NO NO 50 473602 - $25.94
/case

SP4736-CG - 
$27.55 $25.08 $24.72 Royal Paper $24.72

A-21 Suprox Case Hillyard HIL0083825 NO NO 50 $98.92 Hillyard $98.92

A-22 Clean by Peroxy® 15 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4820 NO NO 50 482002 - $70.71
/case

SP4820-CG - 
$75.01 $62.00 $67.40 ImperialDade $62.00

A-23
Eco Hydrogen 
Cleaner - E15

Case Buckeye 60151400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-24 Top Clean Case Hillyard HIL0081025 NO NO 50 $127.88 Hillyard $127.88

A-25
TriBase® Multi 

Purpose Cleaner 17
4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4830 NO NO 50 483002 - $49.83

/case
SP4830-CG - 

$52.87 $45.63 $47.50 ImperialDade $45.63

A-26 Windo-Clean Case Hillyard HIL0080225 NO NO 20 $120.04 Hillyard $120.04

A-27
BioRenewables® 
Glass Cleaner 18

4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4835 NO NO 50 483502 - $55.05
/case

SP4835-CG - 
$58.35 $50.12 $52.43 ImperialDade $50.12

A-28 Q.T. Plus Arsenal 24 Case Hillyard HIL0082425 NO NO 5 $99.40 Hillyard $99.40

A-29 Metaquat 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4840 NO NO 50 484002 - $44.03
/case

SP4840-CG - 
$46.70 $45.25 $41.99 Royal Paper $41.99

A-30

One-Step 
Disinfectant-

Deodorizer-Cleaner - 
E22

Case Buckeye 60221400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-31 Eco Glass cleaner E12 Case Buckeye 60121400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-32
Non-Acid Restroom 
Disinfectant/Cleaner

Case Hillyard HIL0081925 NO NO 75 $75.84 Hillyard $75.84

A-33 Robusto Case Hillyard HIL0084225 NO NO 75 $110.52 Hillyard $110.52
A-34 QT 5 Case Hillyard HIL0084625 NO NO 50 $136.25 Hillyard $136.25

A-35 BNC-15 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4856 NO NO 50 485602 - $128.28
/case

SP4856-CG - 
$139.60 $110.86 $122.27 ImperialDade $110.86

Biohazard

A-36
Deodorant-vomit 

absorb
Each/Canister YES YES 100 015000 - $3.15 

each BD166 - $53.65
Triple S absorb 
Powder - $49.99

/case
$43.45 Royal Paper $43.45
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Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #

Sub 
Allowed

Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item Brady Plus Buckeye Clayton Paper Hillyard ImperialDade Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pyramid School Products Royal Paper
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A-37
Deodorant-vomit 

absorb
Each/Bag YES YES 50 BD170 - $19.32 

Doz/bags

Tolco #260099 - 25 
- 1lb Bags - $3.24 

Bag

Clayton 
Paper & 
Pyramid 
School

$19.32 
doz/bags & 

$3.24

C3 Supplies

A-37 Nutra-Rinse Case Hillyard HIL0071622 NO NO 15 HIL0071522 - 
$172.31 Hillyard $172.31

A-38 Shineline Floor Prep 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP3029 NO NO 50 SP3029-04 - 
$29.40 $28.12 $27.04 Royal Paper $27.04

A-39
Suprox: C3 (6- 1/2 

gal/case)
Case Hillyard HIL0070422 NO NO 50 $110.25 Hillyard $110.25

A-40
Eco Neutral 

Disinfectant E23
Case Buckeye 60231400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-41 X-EFFECT 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP4857 NO NO 50 485702 - $39.39
/case

SP4857-CG - 
$37.94 $36.56 $37.55 Imperial 

Dade $36.56

Carpet Care

A-42 Extraction Shampoo 5 Gal YES YES 50 FCCCEX1 - 
$10/Gal

SP3096-5 - 
$47.80

Tripls S FiberAll 
- $91.75/pail SP3092 - $37.65 Royal Paper $37.65

A-43
Jet Stream 

(Extraction Carpet 
Cleaner)

Gal Buckeye 53055000 NO NO 50 $89 (4 x 1 Gal) Buckeye $89.00

A-44 Xtraction II  9 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP473802 NO NO 50 473802 - $42.72
/case

SP4738-CG - 
$39.99 $40.60 $40.72 Clayton 

Paper $39.99

A-45 Defoamer Case/ 1 Gal Hillyard HIL0018304 NO NO 60 HIL0018306 - 
$125.49 Hillyard $125.49

A-46 Defoam Gal Buckeye 54101000 NO NO 50 $83 (4 x 1 Gal) Buckeye $83.00

A-47 Defoamer 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP302403 NO NO 50 302403 - $67.60
/case

SP3024-04 - 
$85.90 $61.08 $85.86 ImperialDade $61.08

Enzyme

A-48
Cleaner-Enzyme (1 
Gallon Bottle. 4 per 

Case)
Case ENZO-BAC NO NO 30

NLife Zyme 
Away 

Digestaway - 
$41.97/case

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $41.97

A-49
Liquid Enzyme II (1 
Gallon Bottle. 4 per 

Case)
Case Hillyard HIL0047006 NO NO 10 $75.47 Hillyard $75.47

A-50 Consumer 4 - 2L Bottles Spartan SP3097 NO NO 50 SP3097-04 - 
$47.90

Spartan# 4597 
Consumer) -$53.84 $45.83 Royal Paper $45.83

Floor Care

A-51
Dust Mop/Dust Cloth 

Treatment
4-1GL Bottles Spartan SP3013 NO NO 50 301304 - $35.60

/case
SP3013-04 - 

$34.30 $34.40 $33.94 Royal Paper $33.94

A-52
Aqua Dust (Water-

Emulsified Dust Mop 
Conditioner)

Gal Buckeye 54085000 NO NO 50 $58.79 (4 x 1 Gal) Buckeye $58.79

A-53
Hil-Mist Dust Mop 

Treatment
Gal Hillyard  HIL0021306 NO NO 40 $81.41 Hillyard $81.41

A-54
HR 2000 - Hillyard (1 
Gallon Bottle. 4 per 

Case)
Case Hillyard HIL0053806 NO NO 10 No Bid - 

Discontined
No Bid - 

Discontined

A-55 Bounce Back 4-1GL Bottles Spartan SP4330 NO NO 50 433004 - $64.27
/case

SP4330-04 - 
$68.20 $59.34 $61.26 ImperialDade $59.34

A-56 Floortonic Gal Buckeye 51011000 NO NO 50 No Bid   No Bid
Floor Care, Gym

A-57
Pre-Game, (1 Gallon 

Bottle. 4 per case) 
Case Hillyard HIL0045206 NO NO 5 $64.12 Hillyard $64.12

A-58
Coliseum Odorless 

Mineral Spirits 
(Waterless Cleaner)

5 Gal Buckeye 51885000 NO NO 50 $138 (5  Gal Pail) Buckeye $138.00

A-59 Strategic Cleaner 4-1GL Bottles Spartan SP5822 NO NO 50 582204 - $39.49
/case

SP5822-04 - 
$41.90 $41.60 $37.64 Buckeye $37.64

A-60 450 Gym Finish 5 Gal Hillyard  HIL0028407 NO NO 5 $280.20 Hillyard $280.20

A-61
Woodforce OMU 50 

Finish 
5 Gal Spartan SP5824-5 NO NO 50 SP5821-5 - 

$140.90 $139.00 $148.95 ImperialDade $139.00

A-62
Coliseium 450 (Oil 

Modified Urethane)
6 Gal Buckeye 51845000 NO NO 50 $204.89 (5 Gal) Buckeye $204.89

Floor Finish

A-68 Endeavour 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0052507 NO NO 775 $96.10 Hillyard $96.10
A-69 White Sun 5 Gal Hillyard SP4050-5 NO NO 50 $74.27 Royal Paper $74.27
A-70 Explorer 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0053407 NO NO 50 $112.30 Hillyard $112.30

A-71 iShine Floor Finish 5 Gal  Spartan SP4055-5 NO NO 50 405505 - $91.18
/case

SP4055-5 - 
$85.55 $83.93 $86.91 ImperialDade $83.93

A-72
Clarion 25 (Microban 

Antimicrobial Floor 
Fini)

Gal Buckeye 51315000 NO NO 500 $103.11 (5 Gal) Buckeye $103.11
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Required
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Floor Stripper $85.50 $49.00
A-73 Power Strip 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0015007 NO NO 800 $52.94 Hillyard $52.94

A-74
Shineline Emulsifier 

Plus
5 Gal  Spartan SP0084-5 NO NO 50 008405 - $68.38

/case
SP0084-5 - 

$64.20 $64.62 $65.18 Clayton 
Paper $64.20

A-75

S.W.A.T NA (Cold 
Water Non-

Ammoniated 
Stripper)

Gal Buckeye 50355000 NO NO 50 $84.89 (5 Gal) Buckeye $84.89

A-76
RipSaw Floor 

Stripper
5 Gal Buckeye 50255000 NO NO 25 $115.89 (5 Gal) Buckeye $115.89

A-77 L.O.E. Stripper 5 Gal  Spartan SP006104 NO NO 50 006105 - $79.72
/case

SP0061-5 - 
$74.90

6104 is Gal - $59.90; 
6105 is 5 Gal Pail - 

$74.22
$75.99 ImperialDade Gal - $59.90 & 

5 Gal - $74.22

A-78 Juggernaut 5 Gal Buckeye NO NO 50 $158.47 (5 Gal) Buckeye $158.47

A-79
Shineline Emulsifier 

Plus
5 Gal  Spartan SP0084-5 NO NO 50 008405 - $68.38

/case
SP0084-5 - 

$64.20 $64.62 $65.18 Clayton 
Paper $64.20

A-80 Baseboard Stripper Case HIL0113355 NO NO 40 $53.88 Hillyard $53.88

A-81
Shineline Baseboard 

Stripper
 12 Bottles/Case 

20 oz RTU Aerosol
SP6097 NO NO 50 609700 - $46.02

/case
SP6097-AE - 

$43.25 $41.74 $40.79 Royal Paper $40.79

A-82
Base Hit (Baseboard 

Stripping Gel)
Can Buckeye 55459000 NO NO 50 $101.19 (12 Cans) Buckeye $101.19

Fogger

A-83
Sanitizing Fogger 

Aerosol
Case Hillyard YES YES 50 $93.00 NLG Prodigious 

- $76.39 $108.93
Hillyard & 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

$93 & $76.39

General Purpose

A-84 Bleach Gal YES YES 75 N71BB06NN - 
$3.77/Gal

BZ73000039 - 
$3.56 $5.62 Brady Plus $3.56

A-85 EXPO Cleaner Gal YES YES 45 SP3262-4 - $8.99 Expo cleaner - 
$24.29/Gal $30.73

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$8.99 & $24.29

A-86 Fast & Easy 4 -  1 Gal Bottles  Spartan SP3262 NO NO 50 326204 - $33.44
/case

SP3262-4 - 
$32.20 $34.84 $31.87 Royal Paper $31.87

A-87

Marauder H202 
(Environmental 

General Purpose 
Cleaner)

Gal Buckeye 52651000 NO NO 50 $97.34 Buckeye $97.34

A-88 Vinegar Gal YES YES 50 PPC9010 - $3.94 Select Harvest - 
$3.85/Gal $4.01 Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc. $3.85

A-89
Aerosol Furniture 

Polish
Case Chase Chase 41-09 YES YES 5 ZX494725 - 

$44.57
Triple S #21151 

- $46.81/case $37.98/case
Pyramid 
School 

Products
$37.98

A-90
Status Classic Aerosol 

(Furniture Polish)
Can Buckeye 55409000 NO NO 50 $64.39 (12 Cans) Buckeye $64.39

A-91
Citro Shield Furniture 

Polish
 12 Bottles/Case 

18 oz RTU Aerosol
 Spartan SP6120 NO NO 50 612000 - $45.65

/case
SP6120-AE - 

$42.75 $41.55 $40.38 Royal Paper $40.38

A-92
I-Force SM-1 

Degreaser
Case Hillyard HIL0048706 YES YES 15 $100.65 Hillyard $100.65

A-93
SD-20 All Purpose 

Degreaser
 12 Bottles/Case 

18 oz RTU Aerosol
 Spartan SP6520 NO NO 50 652000 - $44.34

/case $41.75 $40.86 Propel - $46.99
/case $39.31 Royal Paper $39.31

A-94
XL-100 (Heavy-Duty 
Cleaner/Degreaser)

Gal Buckeye 50501000 YES YES 50 $62.79 (4 x 1 Gal)
Triple S 

Maverick - 
$14.99/Ga;

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $14.99

Hand Sanitizer 

A-95
Hand Sanitizer 

Foaming
Case Hillyard HIL0041003 NO NO 50 $80.82 Hillyard $80.82

A-96
Hand Sanitizer 

Dispensers for N-01
Case Hillyard NO NO 50 Free (w/sanitizer 

purchase) Hillyard
Free 

(w/sanitizer 
purchase)

A-97
Foaming Hand 

Saitizer 6x1250 ml
Case of 6 Symmetry

90051120; 
Dispenser Prestige 
Black 9960001 Free 

with Purchase of 
soap

NO NO 50 $105.39 Buckeye $105.39

A-98
FoamyiQ Lemon 

Blossom Foaming 
Hand Sanitizer

4 -1250ML Carts  Spartan SP4604 NO NO 50 SP4610-CS - 
$40.54

Lemon Blossom 
Discounted and 

replace by # 4610 - 
$42.97

$43.39 Clayton 
Paper $40.54

A-99
Purell Sanitizer 8oz 

bottles
Case NO NO 50 9652-12 - $44.88

/case

GOJO Purell - 
GoJ96512 - 12 
oz - 12 per case 
- $56.89/case; 
GOJ365972 - 4 
oz - 24 per case 

- $52.79/case

Brady Plus $44.88

A-100
Foam Sanitizer Pump 

Bottles 12x550 ml
Case - (18.6 oz 

bottles)
Symmetry 90050050 NO NO 50 $149.11 (12 Bottles) Buckeye $149.11

Hand Soap - Hair and Body Liquid Soap
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A-101
Cleaner Hand Gel 
Pumice Cherry  2L

 4/Case GOJO GOJ729004 NO NO 20 $124.00 GOJ729004 - 
$98.99/case $84.65 Royal Paper $84.65

A-102
Disp Soap Push Pro 
TDX20000 2L Gray

Case GOJO GOJ720001 NO NO 10 $22.00 $13.05 Royal Paper $13.05

A-103
Industrail Hand Wash 

4x2000 ml
Case Symmetry 90181200 NO NO 50 $80.78 Buckeye $80.78

A-104
Alpine Dispenser 2 

Liter 
Case Symmetry 99810001 NO NO 50 Free (w/soap 

purchase) Buckeye Free (w/soap 
purchase)

A-105
Grub Scrub® (Flat 

Top) 
4 -  1 Gal Bottles  Spartan SP2810 NO NO 50 287004 - $61.67

/case
SP281-04 - 

$61.20 $56.58 $58.79 ImperialDade $56.58

A-106
Soap, Hand Liquid, 

800ml cart.
Case/12 Boardwalk 8100 YES YES 300 WL110800-12BL 

- $38.75 $44.87/case

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$38.75 & 
$44.87

A-107
FoamyiQ® Cranberry 

Ice® Foaming 
Handwash

4 - 1250ML Carts  Spartan SP4602 NO NO 50 460200 - $36.30
/case

SP4602-CS - 
$33.20 $34.16 $37.20 Clayton 

Paper   $33.20

A-108
Green Cerified 

Foaming Hand Wash 
6x1250 ml

Case Symmetry 90091120 NO NO 50 $61.33 Buckeye $61.33

A-109
Prestige Black 

Dispenser
Case Symmetry 99800001 NO NO 50 Free (w/soap 

purchase) Buckeye Free (w/soap 
purchase)

A-110
Antimicrobial 

Foaming Handwash 
6x1250 ml

Case of 6x1250 Symmetry 90031120 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-111
Symmetry Alpine 
White Dispenser

Case Symmetry 99610001 NO NO 50 Free (w/soap 
purchase) Buckeye Free (w/soap 

purchase)

A-112
Hair Hand, Body 

LIquid 
Case of 6x1250 Symmetry 90081120 NO NO 20 $71.49 Buckeye $71.49

Hand Soap Affinity/Dispensers

A-113
Affinity Citrus Fresh 

Antimicrobial 
Foaming Hand Soap

Case Affinity HIL0040803 NO NO 200 $51.13 Hillyard $51.13

A-114
Affinity Foamy Soap 

and Hand Soap 
Dispenser

Case Affinity HIL22281 NO NO 50 Free (w/soap 
purchase) Hillyard Free (w/soap 

purchase)

A-115
foamyiQ Eucalyptus 

Mint Sanitizing 
Handwash

4 - 1250ML Carts  Spartan SP460300 NO NO 50 460300 - $46.29
/case

SP4603-CS - 
$43.44 $42.55 $38.39 Royal Paper $38.39

Hand Soap GOJO/Dispensers

Insecticide

A-116 Insecticide-aero Case Zenex 495785 YES YES 1 ZX495785 - 
$87.51

Clayton 
Paper $87.51

A-117
F-6 Flying Insect 

Killer
12 - 16oz Cans 

RTU Aerosol
 Spartan SP6919 NO NO 50 691900 - $59.09

/case
SP6919-AE - 

$54.97 $53.68 $52.39 Royal Paper $52.39

A-118
Insecticide-wasp-

aero
Case Zenex 495975 YES YES 25 ZX495975 - 

$56.21

Enforcer - 
$59.99/case; NL 

Bee Bopper - 
$51.54/case

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$56.21 & 
$59.99/$51.54

$51.54 Nu-Life Labs
12 - 16oz Cans 

RTU Aerosol
 Spartan SP6820 YES YES 50 682000 - $62.07

/case
SP6820 - AE - 

$56.74 $56.27 NL Bee Bopper - 
$51.54/case $55.02 Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc. $51.54

Laundry

A-120
Laundry Detergent 

Powder
50lb Hillyard HIL00765 NO NO 20 $99.51 Hillyard $99.51

A-121 Builder Laundry 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0995407 NO NO 10 $114.83 Hillyard $114.83

A-122
Sour 

Laundry/Softener
5 Gal Hillyard HIl0011407 NO NO 10 $151.03 Hillyard $151.03

A-123
Bleach Laundry 

Oxygen
5 Gal Hillyard HIL0913207 NO NO 15 $149.59 Hillyard $149.59

A-124 HS Detergent 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0997007 NO NO 10 $203.97 Hillyard $203.97

A-125
Premium Hand Dish 

Wash Liquid
Gal Hillyard HIL0037306 NO NO 5 $20.83 Hillyard $20.83

A-126
Detergent Dish 12 

Above met Saf 1 Gal
Case Hillyard HIL0350306 NO NO 5 $147.91 Hillyard $147.91

A-127 Dish Sanitizer H-129 Case Hillyard HIL0012906 NO NO 5 $115.37 Hillyard $115.37

A-128
Rinse Aid Dish 14 

Above 
Gal Hillyard HIL0012906 NO NO 5 HIL0100306 - 

$118.49 Hillyard HIL0100306 - $118.49

Remover

A-129
Goof Off - Graffiti 

Remover
Each WM Barr FG673 NO NO 80 No Bid No Bid

A-130
Workout (tHE Muscle 

Cleaner Aerosol)
Can Buckeye 55499000 NO NO 50 $76 (12 x 1 cans) Buckeye $76.00

A-131 Muscle Cleaner E14 Case Buckeye 60141400 NO NO 50 No Bid No Bid

A-132 Orange Tough 15
12 Bottles/Case 

32 oz. RTU Bottles
 Spartan SP2216 NO NO 50 221603 - $54.52 SP2216-12 - 

$54.65 $50.28 $45.22 Royal Paper $45.22

A-133
Green Solutions 

Industrial Cleaner 
105

Case  Spartan SP351502 NO NO 50 351502 - $51.27 SP3515-CG - 
$49.99 $46.89 ImperialDade $46.89

A-134
Gum Remover - 

Aerosol
Case Chase CH433-4107 YES YES 70 ZX486855 - 

$61.35

Triple S Gum 
Remover - 
$47.99/case

$36.98 case
Pyramid 
School 

Products
$36.98
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A-135
Gum, Tar & Oil 

Remover (Carpet 
Spotter)

Pint Buckeye 53650400 NO NO 50 $41.49 (6 per case) Buckeye $41.49

A-136
Chewing Gum 

Remover
12 - 6.5 oz Cans 

RTU Aerosol
 Spartan SP6445 NO NO 20 644500 - $60.53 SP6445-AE - 

$56.80 $54.94 $53.66 Royal Paper $53.66

A-137 Gum-Go , Liquid QT Hillyard HIL0091204 NO NO 4 $21.23 Hillyard $21.23
Restroom Cleaner

A-138
Light Acid Bowl 

Cleaner
Case of QT Renown REN02835-MS YES YES 10 CB9212 - $40.72

Simoviz Royal 
Flush - $26.99

/case

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $26.99

A-139
Dy-Phase Color 
Indicating Bowl 

Cleaner
Quart Buckeye 52550600 NO NO 50 $60.49 (12 x 1) Buckeye $60.49

A-140 M*95
 12  - Bottles/Case 
32 oz. RTU Bottles

 Spartan SP7115 YES YES 50 711503 - $29.64 SP7115-12 - 
$25.70 $27.14 $22.40 Royal Paper $22.40

Urinal Screens

A-141 Urinal screens
Box of 10/cotton 

blossom
Renown REN03123 YES YES 50 MB623 - $19.89 

Box HS3901 - $9.84
FRS3WD60CBL
BX - $19.95/box 

of 10
$19.86

Clayton 
Paper & 

Royal Paper
$9.84 & $19.86

A-142
Urinal Screen Wave 
3D Cotten Blossom 

10/box
Box of 10 Fresh Products  NO NO 150 FRS3WDS-CB - 

$21.70 $22.49
FRS3WD60CBL
BX - $19.95/box 

of 10

3WDSCB - 6 
Bx/Case Full cases 

only - $19.98

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$21.70 & 
$19.95

A-143
Urinal Screen Wave 

3D CUC Melon 
10/box

Box of 10 Fresh Products  NO NO 50 FRS3WES-CM- - 
$21.70 $22.49

FRS3WD60CM
E - $19.95/box 

of 10

3WDSCM - 6 
Bx/case Full cases 

only - $19.98

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$21.70 & 
$19.95

A-144
Urinal Screen 

Cucumber melon
Box of 10 Hospeco 401244 YES YES 50 HS-AWU5237-BX 

- $14.60

Triple S Wave 
Green - $19.95

/box of 10

6 Bx/case Full 
cases only - $19.59

Pyramid 
School 

Products
$14.60

A-145
Airlift Ultra Fragrant 

Urinal Screen 
Xcelente Scent

Case of 12  Spartan SP8009-BOX NO NO 50 800900 - $29.95 
Box

SP8009-BX - 
$186.90 $31.32 $31.03 Royal Paper $31.03

Wipes

A-146
Clorox Disinfecting 

Wipes
Each/75 Count

CLO15949/BUN159
49

NO NO 10 CF3838 - $33.88 
(6/case)

CLO15949CT - 
$35.40

CLO15949 - 6 
per case- 

$37.79/case

6 Tubs/Case Full 
Case Only - $6.59 

each tub

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$35.40 & 
$37.79

A-147 Disinfecting Wipes Each/75 Count YES NO 10 MON6430150300
1 - $39.90

Monk Wipes - 
80 per canister - 

6 per case - 
$27.99/case

Broadwalk 
(BWK455W75) 6 
Tubs/Case Full 

Case Only - $5.99 
each tub

SP108606 - $53.58 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $27.99

A-148 All Purpose Wipes Case/75 Count Hillyard HIL21411 NO NO 10 $29.97 Hillyard $29.97


